From: Info <infol@mountainairmechanical.com>
Sent: 6/26/2018 11:12:33 AM

To: 'Kate Slagle' <kslagle@ashevillenc.gov>
Cc:

Subject: RE: 53 College St

Thank you Kate!!
From: Kate Slagle [mailto:kslagle @ashevillenc.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, June 26, 2018 9:53 AM

To: info@mountainairmechanical.com
Subject: 53 College St

The permit number is 18-04870 and the fee is $104. Please let me know if T can assist you with anything else.

Thanks,
Kate

KATE SLAGLE
CITY OF ASHEVILLE
PERMIT FACILITATOR

DEVELOPMENT SERVICES DEPARTMENT

(00> 50 5,7

(22 50-5670



