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PARTF grant

4 messages

Rusty ELLIS - REC CENTER <rustyellis@jacksonnc.org>

Jennifer Bennett - Rec. <jenniferbennett@jacksonnc.org>
To: Rusty ELLIS - REC CENTER <rustyellis@jacksonnc.org>

Wasn't sure if you had responded to Wooten yet or not but | spoke with LuAnn today and the 18 months is the time that we have to apply for the grant from the time that we get the waiver.

For example: If we receive the waiver in November then we would be good to apply for the 2016 grant cycle and then if we didn't get it we would still be able to use the same waiver to apply for the 2017 waiver (if i did the math right, it's late :))
So to clarify, the 18 months doesn't have anything to do with the project completion date, just the application.

| can start working on the waiver as soon as i get home and i think we can turn it around pretty quickly if we can push the commissioners to not accept ownership until we have the waiver approved.

thanks!

Jennifer Bennett

Outdoor Recreation Manager

Jackson County Parks and Recreation Department
(P) 828.293.3053 (F) 828.293.3215

E-mail correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third parties by an authorized county official.

Mon, Oct 19, 2015 at 10:32 PM

Rusty ELLIS - REC CENTER <rustyellis@jacksonnc.org>
To: "Jennifer Bennett - Rec." <jenniferbennett@jacksonnc.org>

Yes | have talked with him and I’'m speaking at the workshop this afternoon about the Capital Projects. The Greenway Master Plan update is that $100,000 figure correct? How are things going at the conference?

Projects.......... 1 Feasibility/Pro-Forma Study for indoor Pool
2 Savannah Community Park
3 Locate and Purchase Property for Whittier Community
4 Update Greenway Master Plan

5 Develop Community Park at Smokey Mountain Elementary School

Rusty Ellis, Director

Jackson County Parks and Recreation Department
88 Cullowhee Mtn Rd

Cullowhee, NC 28723

828-293-3053

828-293-3215 (Fax)

http://rec.jacksonnc.org

www. com/Jack R

arks
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[Quoted text hidden]

Jennifer Bennett <jenniferbennett@jacksonnc.org>
To: Rusty ELLIS - REC CENTER <rustyellis@jacksonnc.org>

There was the master plan menu that Davis gave us so we could piece meal what we wanted | can resend that to you when | get to my computer if you don't have
Off top of my head | think a full redo was 75-85k but I'll double check. Those numbers are from beginning of year but would think they are still close .

Jennifer Bennett

This message sent from my iPhone. Please excuse any typos or mistakes.

On Oct 20, 2015, at 8:07 AM, Rusty ELLIS - REC CENTER <rustyellis@jacksonnc.org> wrote:

Yes | have talked with him and I'm speaking at the workshop this afternoon about the Capital Projects. The Greenway Master Plan update is that $100,000 figure correct? How are things going at the conference?

Projects......... 1 Feasibility/Pro-Forma Study for indoor Pool
2 Savannah Community Park
3 Locate and Purchase Property for Whittier Community

4 Update Greenway Master Plan

5 Develop Community Park at Smokey Mountain Elementary School

Rusty Ellis, Director

Jackson County Parks and Recreation Department

Tue, Oct 20, 2015 at 8:07 AM

Tue, Oct 20, 2015 at 8:10 AM
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From: Jennifer Bennett - Rec. [mailto:jenniferbennett@jacksonnc.org]
Sent: Monday, October 19, 2015 10:33 PM

To: Rusty ELLIS - REC CENTER

Subject: PARTF grant

Wasn't sure if you had responded to Wooten yet or not but | spoke with LuAnn today and the 18 months is the time that we have to apply for the grant from the time that we get the waiver.

For example: If we receive the waiver in November then we would be good to apply for the 2016 grant cycle and then if we didn't get it we would still be able to use the same waiver to apply for the 2017 waiver (if i did the math right, it's late :))
So to clarify, the 18 months doesn't have anything to do with the project completion date, just the application.

| can start working on the waiver as soon as i get home and i think we can turn it around pretty quickly if we can push the commissioners to not accept ownership until we have the waiver approved.

thanks!

Jennifer Bennett
Outdoor Recreation Manager
Jackson County Parks and Recreation Department

(P) 828.293.3053 (I) 828.293.3215
E-mail correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third parties by an authorized county official.

E-mail correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third parties by an authorized county official.
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Rusty ELLIS - REC CENTER <rustyellis@jacksonnc.org> Tue, Oct 20, 2015 at 8:15 AM
To: Jennifer Bennett <jenniferbennett@jacksonnc.org>

Ok thank you

[Quoted text hidden]
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