
From: Julie D. Klipp Nicholson
To: Diana Starr
Cc: Kassi L. Day
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Alliance for Hope International
Date: Tuesday, June 26, 2018 9:55:31 AM

Good morning Diana - I've forwarded this records request to our Public Information Officer, Kassi Day, copied on
this email, for processing.

-----Original Message-----
From: Diana Starr <biz@wildthingsdwell.org>
Sent: Sunday, June 24, 2018 7:33 PM
To: Julie D. Klipp Nicholson <Julie.Klipp.Nicholson@buncombecounty.org>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Alliance for Hope International

CAUTION: External email. Do not click links or open attachments unless verified. Use the "Phish Alert" button to
report all suspicious email.

Hi Julie,

Please provide me with copies of all contracts between North Carolina and/or Buncombe County and/or the
Buncombe County FJC and Alliance for Hope International and/or any organizations affiliated with Alliance for
Hope International.

Please provide a list by year of all consulting fees paid to Alliance for Hope International during the set-up phase of
the Buncombe County FJC and the annual fees paid by Buncombe County or any agency paying fees for the
Buncombe County FJC to Alliance for Hope International and/or any organization affiliated with Alliance for Hope
International.

Please provide your employment contract and salary history with Buncombe County and your employment contract
with Alliance for Hope International and any payments you have received and will continue to receive from
Alliance for Hope International or any organization affiliated with Alliance for Hope International.

Thank you very much.

Diana
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