
Subject: LPR SPECS

From: DJ Ramirez <djramirez@TTSI.CC>

Date: 4/24/2014 9:46 AM

To: CPARK-L@LISTS.PSU.EDU

Mrs. Tindel,

I would be interested in seeing the LPR specifications.

Thanks,

DJ Ramirez
Texas Technical Services, Inc. 
10405 Rockley Rd. 
Houston, TX 77099
t:  281.568.8874 
f:  281.598.4817
e:  djramirez@ttsi.cc

Sent from my iPad

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------

 This communication (including any attachments) may contain privileged or confidential 
information of Texas Technical Services, Inc. and is intended for a specific individual.  
If you are not the intended recipient, you should delete this communication, including 
any attachments without reading or saving them in any manner, and you are hereby 
notified that any disclosure, copying, or distribution of this communication, or the 
taking of any action based on it, is strictly prohibited.

On Apr 24, 2014, at 8:32 AM, "Elizabeth Tindel" <etindel@KENNESAW.EDU> wrote:

I would love a copy as well. We currently use T2 but it's time to go back
out to bid, and we want to have more functionality, including LPR
integration. It would be great to review your specs in preparation for
writing our new ones. And, if anyone is interested I have LPR specs that
are extremely thorough....

Thanks,
Beth Tindel

Beth A. Tindel
Director
Department of Parking & Transportation
Auxiliary Services & Programs
Chair, Parking & Transportation Committee
678.797.2558
etindel@kennesaw.edu
http://parking.kennesaw.edu
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-----Original Message-----
From: Campus Parking System Administration [mailto:CPARK-L@lists.psu.edu]
On Behalf Of Debbie Richeson
Sent: Thursday, April 24, 2014 6:26 AM
To: CPARK-L@LISTS.PSU.EDU
Subject: Re: [CPARK-L] Software question

Charles,

I would love to have the copy of your RFP.

Debbie Richeson

Sent from my iPad

On Apr 23, 2014, at 10:14 AM, "Charles J. DeBow"

<cdebow@STATECOLLEGEPA.US> wrote:

We use T2 Flex as well. If you want my RFP send me an email and can

provide it to you. 

Charles J. DeBow
Parking Manager
Borough of State College
243 South Allen Street
State College, PA 16801
(814) 278-4769  x4700
(814) 234-7148

-----Original Message-----
From: Campus Parking System Administration

[mailto:CPARK-L@lists.psu.edu] On Behalf Of Lori Elkins

Sent: Monday, April 21, 2014 3:44 PM
To: CPARK-L@LISTS.PSU.EDU
Subject: Software question

Our IT department would like to consolidate our parking software

programs i= nto one program that will handle permits, tickets, access
revenue controls,=  and pay stations.  Currently, we use 3 different
software providers.  If y= ou are using a software provider that can
handle all three of these areas (= or at least combines 2), please email
me the name of the software and the p=

rovider.    Thanks, Lori

Lori Elkins
Assistant Director of Public Safety
for Traffic and Parking Services
Indiana State University
210 N 6th Street
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Terre Haute IN  47809
(812) 237-8888
Lori.Elkins@indstate.edu<mailto:Lori.Elkins@indstate.edu>
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